
Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025 
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies 

1000 PAPERS - PREMIUM COPIER, ECONOMY COPIER, COVER STOCKS - WHITES, COLORS 
 BRILLIANT COLORS 8 1/2 X 11, 8 1/2 x 14 

  

     

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

       
                               

Supply 
Area 

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid 

Cascade 
School 

Supplies 

Central MI 
Paper Paper 101 Quill LLC 

OFF. 1000 

Paper Super Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 Pound, 
Premium #4 Sulfite White Minimum Brightness, 92 Pkgd In Moisture 
Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets Per Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
White 

Case of 
10 Reams  $ 53.00 $ 33.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$34.47 

$ 45.99 

OFF. 1003 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Blue 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 53.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$49.71 

$ 54.49 

OFF. 1004 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Goldenrod    

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 53.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$49.71 

$ 61.86 

OFF. 1005 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Green 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 53.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$49.71 

$ 61.35 

OFF. 1006 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Pink 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 53.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$49.71 

$ 61.35 

OFF. 1007 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Canary 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 53.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$49.71 

$ 59.88 

OFF. 1008 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Buff   

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 53.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$53.71 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1009 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Gray   

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 53.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$53.71 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1010 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Salmon 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 53.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$53.71 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1011 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Ivory 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 53.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$53.71 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1012 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Cream 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$53.71 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1013 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Pumpkin   

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$53.71 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1014 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Cherry 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 53.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$53.71 

$ 73.22 



  

     

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025 
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies 

Supply 
Area 

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid 

Cascade 
School 

Supplies 

Central MI 
Paper Paper 101 Quill LLC 

OFF. 1015 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Orchid 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 53.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$53.71 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1017 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Tan 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$53.71 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1018 

Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 14 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Premium #4 
Sulfite, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams Per Case 92+ 
White 

Case of 
10 Reams  $ 77.40 $ 51.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$55.34 

$ 67.56 

OFF. 1019 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 14 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Pink 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$82.95 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1020 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 14 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Blue 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 96.60 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$82.95 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1021 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 14 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams Per Case 
Goldenrod 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$82.95 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1022 
Paper Premium Copier, 8.5 Inch X 14 Inch, 20/50 Pound, Pkgd In 
Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Case 
Canary 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 96.60 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$82.95 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1023 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 
Pound, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams/Case, 
Brights Fuschia 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$84.34 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1024 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 
Pound, Pkgd In Moisture Proof  Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams/Case  
Brights Canary 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$84.34 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1025 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 
Pound, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams/Case 
Brights Blue 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$84.34 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1026 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 
Pound, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Reams, 10 
Reams/Case 
Brights Electric Green 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$84.34 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1027 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 
Pound, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams/Case 
Brights Violet 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$84.34 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1028 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 
Pound, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams/Case         
Brights Orange 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$84.34 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1029 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 
Pound, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams/Case         
Brights Purple 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$84.34 

 No Bid 



  

     

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025 
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies 

Supply 
Area 

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid 

Cascade 
School 

Supplies 

Central MI 
Paper Paper 101 Quill LLC 

OFF. 1030 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 
Pound, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams/Case 
Brights Cobalt (blue) 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$84.34 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1031 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 
Pound, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams/Case 
Brights Electric Yellow 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$84.34 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1032 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 
Pound, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams/Case 
Brights Red 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$84.34 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1033 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 
Pound, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams/Case 
Brights Key Lime 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$84.34 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1034 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 
Pound, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams/Case 
Brights Electric Orange 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$84.34 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1035 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 
Pound, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams/Case 
Brights Gold 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$84.34 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1036 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 
Pound, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams/Case 
Brights Teal 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$84.34 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1037 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 
Pound, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams/Case 
Brights Electric Red 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$84.34 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1038 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 20/50 
Pound, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams/Case 
Brights Artic Orange 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$84.34 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1042 

Paper Super Premium Ink Jet Copier, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 24 Pound 
Heavy Weight, Minimum 94 Brightness, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 
Reams/Case, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, Laser Sharp, 92+ 
White 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$45.01 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1043 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 24/60 
Pound Heavy Weight, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 
Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Case, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Fireball Fuschia 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 101.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$99.40 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1044 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 24/60 
Pound Heavy Weight, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 
Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Case, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Sunburst Yellow 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 101.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$99.40 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1045 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 24/60 
Pound Heavy Weight, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 
Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Case, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Terrestrial Teal 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 101.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$99.40 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1046 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 24/60 
Pound Heavy Weight, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 
Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Case, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Gamma Green 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 101.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$99.40 

 No Bid 



  

     

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

  
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

 
 

 

 
 

Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025 
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies 

Supply 
Area 

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid 

Cascade 
School 

Supplies 

Central MI 
Paper Paper 101 Quill LLC 

OFF. 1047 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 24/60 
Pound Heavy Weight, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 
Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Case, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Planetary Purple 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 101.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$99.40 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1048 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 24/60 
Pound Heavy Weight, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 
Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Case Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Orbit Orange 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 101.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$99.40 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1049 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 24/60 
Pound Heavy Weight, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 
Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Case, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Venus Violet 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 101.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$99.40 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1050 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 24/60 
Pound Heavy Weight, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 
Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Case Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Lunar Blue 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 101.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$99.40 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1051 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 24/60 
Pound Heavy Weight, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 
Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Case Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Solar Yellow 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 101.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$99.40 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1052 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 24/60 
Pound Heavy Weight, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 
Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Case, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Rocket Red 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 101.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$99.40 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1053 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 24/60 
Pound Heavy Weight, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 
Sheets/Reams, 10 Reams/Case Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Martian Green 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 101.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$99.40 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1054 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 24/60 
Pound Heavy Weight, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 
Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Case, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Cosmic Orange 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 101.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$99.40 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1055 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 24/60 
Pound Heavy Weight, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 
Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Case, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Galaxy Gold 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 101.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$99.40 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1056 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 24/60 
Pound Heavy Weight, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 
Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Case, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Celestial Blue 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 101.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$99.40 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1057 

Paper Premium Copier Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 24/60 
Pound Heavy Weight, Pkgd In Moisture Proof Wrapper, 500 
Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Case Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Re-Entry Red 

Case of 
10 Reams  No Bid $ 101.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$99.40 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1061 
Paper Cover Stock, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 65 Pound, 2,000 
Sheets/Carton, Wausau Or Mill Equiv. 
Bright White 

Carton of 
2000 

Sheets
 No Bid $ 63.00 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$58.65 

$ 102.83 

OFF. 1062 
Paper Cover Stock Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 65 Pound, 2,000 
Sheets/Carton, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Venus Violet 

Carton of 
2000 

Sheets
 No Bid $ 82.40 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$78.87 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1063 
Paper Cover Stock Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 65 Pound, 2,000 
Sheets/Carton, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Lift-Off Lemon 

Carton of 
2000 

Sheets
 No Bid $ 82.40 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$78.87 

 No Bid 



  

     

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

 
 

Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025 
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies 

Supply 
Area 

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid 

Cascade 
School 

Supplies 

Central MI 
Paper Paper 101 Quill LLC 

OFF. 1064 
Paper Cover Stock Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 65 Pound, 2,000 
Sheets/Carton, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Lunar Blue 

Carton of 
2000 

Sheets
 No Bid $ 82.40 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$78.87 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1065 
Paper Cover Stock Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 65 Pound, 2,000 
Sheets/Carton, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Terra Green 

Carton of 
2000 

Sheets
 No Bid $ 82.40 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$78.87 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1066 
Paper Cover Stock Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 65 Pound, 2,000 
Sheets/Carton, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Fireball Fuchsia 

Carton of 
2000 

Sheets
 No Bid $ 82.40 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$78.87 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1067 
Paper Cover Stock Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 65 Pound, 2,000 
Sheets/Carton, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Orbit Orange 

Carton of 
2000 

Sheets
 No Bid $ 82.40 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$78.87 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1068 
Paper Cover Stock Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 65 Pound, 2,000 
Sheets/Carton, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Planetary Purple 

Carton of 
2000 

Sheets
 No Bid $ 82.40 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$78.87 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1069 
Paper Cover Stock Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 65 Pound, 2,000 
Sheets/Carton, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Celestial Blue 

Carton of 
2000 

Sheets
 No Bid $ 82.40 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$78.87 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1070 
Paper Cover Stock Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 65 Pound, 2,000 
Sheets/Carton, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Sunburst Yellow 

Carton of 
2000 

Sheets
 No Bid $ 82.40 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$78.87 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1071 
Paper Cover Stock Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 65 Pound, 2,000 
Sheets/Carton, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Re-Entry Red 

Carton of 
2000 

Sheets
 No Bid $ 82.40 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$78.87 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1073 
Paper Cover Stock Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 65 Pound, 2,000 
Sheets/Carton, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Cosmic Orange 

Carton of 
2000 

Sheets
 No Bid $ 82.40 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$78.87 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1074 
Paper Cover Stock Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 65 Pound, 2,000 
Sheets/Carton, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Galaxy Gold 

Carton of 
2000 

Sheets
 No Bid $ 82.40 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$78.87 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1075 
Paper Cover Stock Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 65 Pound, 2,000 
Sheets/Carton, 
Terrestrial Teal - Bright Hue 

Carton of 
2000 

Sheets
 No Bid $ 82.40 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$78.87 

 No Bid 

OFF. 1076 
Paper Cover Stock Brilliant Color, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, 65 Pound, 2,000 
Sheets/Carton, Astrobright/Mill Equiv. 
Rocket Red 

Carton of 
2000 

Sheets
 No Bid $ 82.40 

 Winning Bid All 
Paper Awarded 
to One Vendor 

$78.87 

 No Bid 



Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies

1200 PAPERS - KRAFT Rolls, POSTER/RAILROAD BOARDS

Supply 
Area

            

            

       

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid
Bye-Mo'r

Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products
Quill LLC

ART 1201 Paper Kraft Duo-Surface Roll, 3 Feet Wide X 1,000 Feet Long, 40 
Pound White 

3 Feet X 
1000 Feet Roll  $  47.00  $  55.80  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid

 $43.49 

ART 1231 Railroad/Poster Board, 22 Inches X 28 Inches, White, 
100 Sheets/Case 4 Ply .017 

Case of 
100 Sheets

 Winning Bid
 $26.00  $  28.20  No Bid  No Bid  $  38.75 

ART 1232 Railroad/Poster Board, 22 Inches X 28 Inches, Assorted Colors On 2 
Sides, 100 Sheets/Case 4 Ply .017 

Case of 
100 Sheets

 Winning Bid
 $33.36  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $  47.14 

1400 PAPER - GRAPH, PENMANSHIP, NOTEBOOK FILLER

Supply 
Area

     

     

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid
Bye-Mo'r

Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products
Quill LLC

OFF. 1405
Paper, Graph, Quadrille, White, Ruled, 1/4 Inch Ruled, One Side, 8.5 
Inch X 11 Inch, White, 500 Sheets Per Ream, 10 Reams Per Case, 
Pacon P2411, Or Equal/Better (Must Specify)               

Case of 
10 Reams

 Winning Bid
 $49.84  $  53.55  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

OFF. 1420
Paper Penmanship, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, White Ruled Short Way, 
Ruled 5/16 Inch Red Margin Line, 16 Pound, Sulfite 3-Hole Punched, 
500 Sheets Per Ream, 10 Reams Per Case

Case of 
10 Reams

 Winning Bid
 $46.90  $  49.20  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

OFF. 1450
Paper Notebook Filler, 8.5 Inch X 11 Inch, White Ruled 3/8 Inch With 
Red Margin Line On Both Sides, 3-Hole Punched, 100 Sheets Per 
Package, 50 Pkgd Per Case

50 Packages 
of 100 Sheets

 Winning Bid
 $68.95  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1500 PAPER Pads: POST-IT, LECTURE

Supply 
Area

            

            

       

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid
Bye-Mo'r

Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products
Quill LLC

OFF. 1510
Self-Stick Note Pads, 100 Sheets Per Pad, 3 Inch X 3 Inch, Yellow, 12 
per package, 18 Pkg Per Carton, Highland 6549 Or Equal/Better 
(Must Specify) 

Carton of 216  $  113.15  No Bid  Winning Bid
 $42.93  $  43.20  No Bid 

OFF. 1545 Pads Lecture Paper Pads For Easels, 27 Inch X 34 Inch, Unruled 
White Perforated, 50 Sheets Per Pad, 4 Pads Per Package

Package of 
4 Pads

 Winning Bid
 $30.13  $  31.24  No Bid  $  35.80  No Bid 

OFF. 1546 Pads Lecture Paper Pads For Easels, 27 Inch X 34 Inch, 
Perforated, 50 Sheets Per Pad, 4 Pads Per Package

Ruled White Package of 
4 Pads

 Winning Bid
 $30.13  No Bid  No Bid  $  35.80  No Bid 



Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025 
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies 

1700 SANITARY PAPERS: FACIAL TISSUE, TOILET TISSUE, PAPER TOWELS, SANITARY NAPKINS 

   
  

 
 

  

  

 
 

 

  
 

  

 

 
 

 
 

 

 
   

 
 

 
 

  
 

 

  

  
  

 

 
   

 
   

  

 
 

 

 

   

  

Supply 
Area 

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid 

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg 

Cascade 
School 

Supplies 

Imperial 
Dade 

Pyramid 
School 

Products 

Quill 
LLC 

CUST. 1705 Facial Tissue 2-Ply Flat Box, 100 Tissues Per Box, 30 
Boxes Per Case, 3,000 Sheets Total 

Case of 
30 Boxes

 Winning Bid
 $19.95 $  38.90 $   25.01  No Bid  $ 32.57 

CUST. 1707 Facial Tissue 2-Ply Flat Box, 100 Tissues Per Box, 36 
Boxes Per Case, 3,600 Sheets Total, Kleenex 21400 

Case of 
36 Boxes

 Winning Bid
 $43.23  No Bid $   46.20  No Bid  $ 53.81 

CUST. 1708 Facial Tissue, 3-Ply, Anti-Viral, 68 Tissues Per Box, 
12 Boxes Per Case, Kleenex #21286 

Case of 
12 Boxes

 Winning Bid
 $28.30  No Bid $   30.25  No Bid  No Bid 

CUST. 1709 
Toilet Tissue Roll, High-Capacity, Jumbo Roll, White, 
Coreless, 3.7 Inches X 1,150 Feet, 2-ply, 13,800 
Linear Feet/Roll, 12 Rolls Per Case, Scott 0700602 

Case of 
12 Rolls

 Winning Bid
 $55.86  No Bid $   59.71  No Bid  $ 69.29 

CUST. 1710 

Toilet Tissue Roll, 4.5 Inches X 4.5 Inches, Soft, 1210 
Sheets Per Roll, 80 Rolls Per Case, 96,800 Sheets 
Per Case, GP14580 Or Cascade 4024 Or 
Equal/Better (Must Specify) 

Case of 
80 Rolls

 Winning Bid
 $51.10  No Bid $   65.76  No Bid  $ 84.86 

CUST. 1712 

Toilet Tissue Roll, 4.09 Inches X 4.0 Inches, 2-Ply 
Soft, 506 Sheets/ Roll, 60 Rolls/ Case, 30,360 Sheets 
Per Case, Cottonelle #17713 Or Equal/Better (Must 
Specify) 

Case of 
60 Rolls

 Winning Bid
 $46.65  No Bid $   49.86  No Bid  $ 59.50 

CUST. 1715 Toilet Tissue Jumbo Roll, Tissue 9 Inch Diameter, 2-
Ply 1,000  Foot Rolls, 12 Rolls Per Case 

Case of 
12 Rolls

 Winning Bid
 $25.28  No Bid $   26.35  No Bid  $ 38.26 

CUST. 1720 
Paper Towels, Single Fold Highly Absorbent Natural, 
9.25"X10.25" Open 9.25"X5.125" Folded, 250 Per 
Package, 16 Packages Per Case, 4,000 Per Case 

Case of 
16 

Packages

 Winning Bid
 $16.11  No Bid $     19.28  No Bid  $ 38.32 

CUST. 1725 
Paper Towels, Multi-Fold Highly Absorbent Natural, 
9.5 Inches X 9.25 Inches, 250 Per Package, 16 
Packages Per  Case, 4,000 Per Case 

Case of 
16 

Packages

 Winning Bid
 $19.27  No Bid $   24.21  No Bid  $ 28.98 

CUST. 1730 
Paper Towels, Multi-Fold Kimberly-Clark White, 9.4" X 
9.2", 150 Per Package, 16 Packages Per Case, 2,400 
Per Case, Kleenex Multifold Towels #01890 

Case of 
16 

Packages

 Winning Bid
 $32.02  No Bid $   34.22  No Bid  $ 38.71 

CUST. 1735 
Paper Towel Rolls, Highly Absorbent Natural, 7-7/8 
Inches Wide, Non-Perforated, 600 Linear Feet Roll, 
12 Rolls Per Case, 7,200 Linear Feet Per Case 

Case of 
12 Rolls

 Winning Bid
 $39.72  No Bid $   65.05  No Bid  $ 43.09 

CUST. 1740 
Paper Towel Rolls, Highly Absorbent Natural, 7-7/8 
Inches Wide, 12 Rolls Per Case, 350 Linear Feet/Roll, 
4,200 Linear Feet/Case 

Case of 
12 Rolls  $   18.87  No Bid  Winning Bid

 $18.73  No Bid  $ 29.73 

CUST. 1745 

Paper Towel Rolls, Highly Absorbent, Recycled Fiber, 
8 Inches Wide, 1.5 Inch Core, 12 Rolls Per Case, 800 
Linear Feet/Roll, 9,600 Linear Feet/Case, Scott 
0414202 

Case of 
12 Rolls

 Winning Bid
 $61.15  No Bid $   65.05  No Bid  $ 72.85 

CUST. 1770 Sanitary Napkin #4 Maxithin, 250 Per Case #4 Case of 
250  $   57.65  No Bid  Winning Bid

 $40.49 $   49.95  $ 40.49 

CUST. 1775 Sanitary Napkin #8 Maxi Pad, 250 Per Case #8 Case of 
250  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid

 $93.55  No Bid 

CUST. 1780 

Sanitary Napkin Bag, Wax Coated Paper, Brown, 9 
Inch L x 3-1/4 Inch W x 10 Inch D, 250 Per Case, 
Health Gards Hospeco 
HS-6141 

Case of 
250  $   45.44  No Bid  Winning Bid

 $16.89 $   16.94  $ 22.52 

CUST. 1790 
Kitchen Paper Towels, 11 Inches X 9.4 Inches, White, 
70 Perforated Sheets/Roll, 1,680 Sheets/Roll, 24 
Rolls/Case 

Case of 
24 Rolls  $   68.40  No Bid  Winning Bid

 $30.51  No Bid  $ 66.54 



Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies

1800 PENCILS

Supply 
Area

        

                     

            

            

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Bye-Mo'r
Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products
Quill LLC

OFF. 1805
Pencils, # 2 Black Lead Hex, Brass Tip With Eraser, 
12 Per Pkg, 6 Pkg per Pack, 20 Packs per case, 
Dixon 12872 Or Equal/Better (Must Specify)

Case of 
1,440  No Bid  $  191.52  No Bid  $  154.00  Winning Bid

 $135.60  No Bid 

ART 1835 Pencils Colored, 12 Assorted Colors Per Box, 12 
Boxes Per Package, Crayola 68-4012 Only

Package of 
12 Boxed 
Sets of 12

 No Bid  $  23.02  No Bid  Winning Bid
 $15.00  $  15.24  $  1.80 

ART 1840 Pencils Colored, 24 Assorted Colors Per Box, 6 Boxes 
Per Package, Crayola 68-4024 Only

Package of 6 
Boxed Sets 

of 24
 No Bid  $  21.69  No Bid  Winning Bid

 $15.00  $  15.24  No Bid 

ART 1845 Pencils Colored, 36 Assorted Colors Per Box, 6 Boxes 
Per Package, Crayola 68-4036 Only

Package of 6 
Boxed Sets 

of 36
 No Bid  $  36.54  No Bid  Winning Bid

 $24.29  $  25.62  No Bid 

2000 MARKERS

Supply 
Area

            

       

            

                                

                              

                            

                  

                          

                          

                            

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Bye-Mo'r
Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products
Quill LLC

ART 2005
Markers Fine Line, 10 Assorted Classic Colors, 
Washable, 6 Sets Per Package, Crayola Classic 58-
7852

Package of 
6 Sets  No Bid  $  20.66  No Bid  Winning Bid

 $15.97  $  16.14  No Bid 

ART 2006 Markers Broad Line, 8 Assorted Bold Colors, 
Washable, 6 Sets Per Package, Crayola 58-7832

Package of 
6 Sets  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $  36.00  Winning Bid

 $11.64  No Bid 

ART 2007 Markers Broad Point, 8 Assorted Classic Colors, 
Washable, 6 Sets Per Package, Crayola 58-7808

Package of 
6 Sets  No Bid  $  20.50  No Bid  $  10.68  Winning Bid

 $10.68  No Bid 

OFF. 2060
Marker White Board Dry Erase, Chisel Point, 4 Color 
Assortment, Expo 80174 Or Equal/Better (Must 
Specify)

Set of 4  No Bid  $  2.45  $  3.42  Winning Bid
 $2.53  $  2.89  $  3.26 

OFF. 2065 Marker White Board Dry Erase, Red, Dozen, Expo 
80002 Or Equal/Better (Must Specify)

Package of 
12  No Bid  $  7.56  $  12.01  Winning Bid

 $8.18  $  8.59  $  8.99 

OFF. 2080 Wet Erase Markers, Fine Point Black, Washable, 12 
Per Package, Expo Vis-A-Vis 16001 Only

Package of 
12  No Bid  $  18.47  $  11.75  Winning Bid

 $8.10  $  8.49  $  8.99 

OFF. 2085 Wet Erase Markers, Fine Point, Assorted, Washable, 8 
Per Package, Expo Vis-A-Vis 16078 Only Package of 8  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $  7.19  $  7.59  Winning Bid

 $7.06 

OFF. 2090 Felt Tip Pens, Medium Point, Black, 12 per package, 
Sanford PaperMate, 8430152 Only

Package of 
12  No Bid  $  19.04  $  12.14  Winning Bid

 $8.18  $  8.69  $  10.51 

OFF. 2091 Felt Tip Pens, Medium Point, Red, 12 per package, 
Sanford PaperMate, 8420152 Only

Package of 
12  No Bid  $  19.04  $  12.14  Winning Bid

 $8.18  $  8.69  $  11.32 

OFF. 2092
Felt Tip Pens, Medium Point, Assorted Color Ink, 12 
per package, 
Sanford PaperMate, 74423 Only

Package of 
12  No Bid  $  20.78  $  11.37  $  9.80  $  9.43  Winning Bid

 $8.67 

OFF. 2093
Felt Tip Pens, Medium Point, Assorted Color Ink, 48 
per package, 
Sanford PaperMate, 4651 Only

Package of 
48  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid

 $38.17 



Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies

2100 CRAYONS

Supply 
Area

                 

Item 
Number Description Unit of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Bye-Mo'r
Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products
Quill LLC

ART 2120 Crayons Wax Regular Size, 24 Assorted Colors Per 
Set, 12 Sets Per Package, Crayola 24 Only

Package of 
12 Sets  No Bid  $  19.49  $  17.40  $  11.79  Winning Bid

 $10.80  No Bid 

2200 PAINT SETS

Supply 
Area

            

Item 
Number Description Unit of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Bye-Mo'r
Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products
Quill LLC

ART 2230

Paint Sets Water Color, Semi-Moist In Plastic Box 
With Hinged Cover Paints In 1/2 Inch Pans, CP 
Certified, 1 Number 7 Camel Hair Brush Included In 
Each Set, 8 Colors Per Set, 6 Sets Per Package, 
Crayola 53-0080 Only

Package of 
6 Sets  No Bid  $  22.26  No Bid  $  21.90  Winning Bid

 $12.30  No Bid 

2400 LABELS

Supply 
Area

                            

Item 
Number Description Unit of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Bye-Mo'r
Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products
Quill LLC

OFF. 2430 Labels Address, 1 Inch X 2 5/8 Inch For Laser Printers, 
30 Labels Per Sheet, 100 Sheets Per Box Box of 3,000  $  74.10  $  41.87  $  31.46  $  6.48  Winning Bid

 $7.49  $  5.02 

2500 LOOSE LEAF NOTEBOOKS

Supply 
Area

                                

                                

Item 
Number Description Unit of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Bye-Mo'r
Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products
Quill LLC

OFF. 2502

Notebook Loose Leaf, 3 Ring 1 Inch Wide, White Vinyl 
Covers, Full Clear Vinyl Pockets On the Outside, 
Front, And Back Covers And Along Spine For 8.5 Inch 
X 11 Inch Paper, Top And Bottom Release Latches  

Each  No Bid  $  2.02  $  1.66  $  1.87  Winning Bid
 $1.99  $  2.46 

OFF. 2504

Notebook Loose Leaf, 3 Ring 2 Inches Wide, White 
Vinyl Covers, Full Clear Vinyl Pockets On Outside, 
Front, And Back Covers And Along Spine For 8.5 Inch 
X 11 Inch Paper, Top And Bottom Release Latches

Each  No Bid  $  2.87  $  2.70  $  2.79  Winning Bid
 $2.99  $  3.58 



Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies

2600 FILE FOLDERS, PORTFOLIOS, COVERS

Supply 
Area

                              

                        

                            

                 

                       

Item 
Number Description Unit of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Bye-Mo'r
Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products
Quill LLC

OFF. 2615 File Folders Letter Size 1/3 Cut Manila, 100 Per Box, 
Oxford 1/3 Or Equal/Better (Must Specify) Box of 100  No Bid  $  8.85  $  15.95  $  9.75  $  8.84  Winning Bid

 $7.93 

OFF. 2620 File Folders Letter Size 1/5 Cut Manila, 100 Per Box, 
Oxford 1/5 Or Equal/Better (Must Specify) Box of 100  No Bid  $  15.72  $  10.30  $  24.80  $  19.95  Winning Bid

 $8.89 

OFF. 2625
File Folders Hanging Letter Size 1/ 5 Cut With Tabs, 
25 Per Box,  Smead No. 64035 Or Equal/Better (Must 
Specify)

Box of 25  No Bid  $  8.41  $  24.92  $  8.39  Winning Bid
 $7.29  $  13.26 

OFF. 2635
Folder Duo Tang Portfolio With Fasteners With Double 
Pockets, Assorted Colors, 25 Per Package Or 
Equal/Better (Must Specify)

Package of 
25  No Bid  $  13.16  $  14.10  $  10.90  Winning Bid

 $12.95  No Bid 

OFF. 2650
Folder Duo Tang Covers No Fasteners With Double 
Pockets Assorted Colors 25 Per Package File - Or 
Equal/Better (Must Specify)

Package of 
25  No Bid  $  8.64  $  9.26  $  7.88  Winning Bid

 $8.49  No Bid 

2700 TRANSPARENCIES

Supply 
Area

            

Item 
Number Description Unit of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Bye-Mo'r
Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products
Quill LLC

OFF. 2745 Transparencies For Use In Copy Machines Without 
Sensing Stripe, 100 Sheets Per Box Box of 100  No Bid  No Bid  $  25.80  No Bid  Winning Bid

 $16.95  $  34.99 

2900 SCISSORS

Supply 
Area

                 

                 

                 

Item 
Number Description Unit of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Bye-Mo'r
Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products
Quill LLC

ART 2915 Scissors 5 Inch Blunt Point Fiskars 194160, 1 Dozen 
Per Package

Package of 
12  No Bid  $  24.19  $  21.60  Winning Bid

 $17.94  $  17.95  No Bid 

ART 2920 Scissors 5 Inch Sharp Point Fiskars 194300, 1 Dozen 
Per Package

Package of 
12  No Bid  $  24.19  $  21.60  Winning Bid

 $17.94  $  17.95  No Bid 

ART 2922 Scissors 7 Inch Sharp Point Fiskars 194580, 1 Dozen 
Per Package

Package of 
12  No Bid  $  36.46  $  12.45  Winning Bid

 $28.62  $  33.48  No Bid 



Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies

3000 ADHESIVES: GLUES, TAPES

Supply 
Area

                       

                     

           

         

            

         

          

          

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Bye-Mo'r
Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Imperial 
Dade

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products

Quill 
LLC

Runyan 
Pottery 
Supply

ART 3017
Glue Stick Washable .74 Ounce Rub-On Glue For 
Paper, Cardboard, Photos, Fast Dry, Acid Free, Non-
toxic

Package of 
12

.74 Ounce 
Tube Stick

 No Bid  $  5.54  $  7.78  No Bid  $  3.93  Winning Bid
 $3.96  No Bid  No Bid 

ART 3018 Glue Stick Washable 1.27 Ounce Rub-On Glue For 
Paper, Cardboard, Fabric, Photos, Polystyrene, Etc.

Package of 
12

1.27 Ounce 
Tube Stick

 No Bid  $  8.40  $  11.09  No Bid  $  6.12  Winning Bid
 $6.12  No Bid  No Bid 

ART 3019
Glue Stick Washable .77 Ounce, Rub-On Glue For 
Paper, Cardboard, Photos, Acid Free, Non-toxic, 
Dries Quickly, Colorlessly

Package of 
30

.77 Ounce 
Tube Stick

 No Bid  $  24.78  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid
 $28.60  $  32.95  No Bid  No Bid 

ART 3020
Glue Stick Washable 1.4 Ounce, Rub-On Glue For 
Paper, Cardboard, Fabric, Photos, Polystyrene, Etc., 
Dries Quickly, Colorlessly

Package of 3
1.4 Ounce 
Tube Stick

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $  5.60  No Bid 
 Winning 

Bid
 $2.54 

 No Bid 

OFF. 3045
Tape Masking 1 Inch Wide X 60 Yards Long, 3 Inch 
Core, 9 Rolls Per Tube, 4 Tubes Per Carton, 36 Rolls 
Per Carton 3M Highland 2600 Series

Carton of 
36 Rolls  No Bid  $  78.83  No Bid  No Bid  $  51.90  Winning Bid

 $51.84  No Bid  No Bid 

OFF. 3048
Tape Masking 2 Inch Wide X 60 Yards Long, 3 Inch 
Core, 6 Rolls Per Tube, 4 Tubes Per Carton, 24 Rolls 
Per Carton 3M Highland 2600  Series

Carton of 
24 Rolls  No Bid  $  132.59  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid

 $65.08  $  65.28  No Bid  No Bid 

OFF. 3051
Tape Transparent, 3/4 Inch X 1296 Inch, I Inch Core, 
12 Rolls Per Tube, 12 Tubes Per Carton, 144 Rolls 
Per Carton Highland 3M6200341296 

Carton of 
144 Rolls  No Bid  $  229.82  No Bid  No Bid  $  96.84  Winning Bid

 $92.16  No Bid  No Bid 

CUST. 3068

Tape Duct, 1.88  Inch X 60.14 Yards, Roll, Utility 
Grade, Silver, Cloth Waterproof Backing, Minimum 7 
Mil Thick, 6 Rolls Per Package, Shurtape PC 7 Or 
Equal/Better

Package of 
6 Rolls  $ 99.60  $  115.33  No Bid  No Bid  $  99.24  Winning Bid

 $72.00  No Bid  No Bid 

3100 STAPLERS

Supply 
Area

                   

              

                  

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Bye-Mo'r
Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Imperial 
Dade

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products

Quill 
LLC

Runyan 
Pottery 
Supply

OFF. 3110 Stapler Office Black Swingline 747Bk Each  No Bid  $  20.61  $  16.71  No Bid  Winning Bid
 $8.59  $  8.95  $  12.81  No Bid 

OFF. 3112 Stapler Office PaperPro inPOWER 20 Desktop 
Stapler, Black/Gray 1106 Each  No Bid  $  10.98  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid

 $9.90  $  9.95  No Bid  No Bid 

OFF. 3114 Stapler Office PaperPro Inspire 15 Compact Stapler, 
15 Sheets, Half-Strip, Black 1493 Each  No Bid  $  6.45  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid

 $6.95  $  6.95  $  9.67  No Bid 

3200 PENCIL SHARPENERS

Supply 
Area

                  

                              

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Bye-Mo'r
Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Imperial 
Dade

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products

Quill 
LLC

Runyan 
Pottery 
Supply

OFF. 3220 Pencil Sharpener Electric, XL Shavings Receptable, X-
Acto 1675X Each  No Bid  Winning Bid

 $29.92  $  44.70  No Bid  $  42.90  $  43.95  $  34.83  No Bid 

CUST. 3230 Pencil Sharpener Manual, All Metal, 8-Hole, Wall or 
Desk Mountable, X-Acto KS 1031 Each  No Bid  $  16.51  $  9.57  No Bid  $  8.39  $  8.79 

 Winning 
Bid

 $8.07 
 No Bid 



Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies

3300 COFFEE, HOT/COLD CUPS, NAPKINS, STIRRERS

Supply 
Area

  

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Bye-Mo'r
Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Imperial 
Dade

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products

Quill 
LLC

Runyan 
Pottery 
Supply

OFF. 3310 Straws White Striped Stirrer/Sip, plastic, 5 inch, 
100/Box, 10 boxes/case Box of 1,000  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

OFF. 3311 Wood coffee stirrer, 5.5”, unwrapped, 1,000/box, 10 
boxes/case

Case of 
10,000  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

OFF. 3320 Coffee Premeasured Coffee in Filter Packs, Regular 
40 - 0.90 oz Filter Packs/Case Folgers Carton of 40  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning 
Bid

 $25.42 
 No Bid 

OFF. 3325 Coffee Premeasured Coffee in Filter Packs, 
Decaffeinated 40 - 0.90 oz Filter Packs/Case Folgers Carton of 40  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 Winning 
Bid

 $30.16 
 No Bid 

Napkin Lunch 1-Ply Opens To 11.25 Inch X 12.5 Inch, Case of 12 
OFF. 3350 1/4 Fold, 500/Package, 12 Packages/Case, 6000 Packages of  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Napkins Cascade 2059, Hp#163600 500

OFF. 3370 Cups Beverage Hot/Cold, 8 Ounce Styrofoam, 1,000 
Per Case Dart 8J8 

Case of 
1000

 Winning 
Bid

 $32.20 
 No Bid  No Bid  $  43.75  No Bid  No Bid  $  36.99  No Bid 

3400 ART CLAY

Supply 
Area

       

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Bye-Mo'r
Inc

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Imperial 
Dade

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products

Quill 
LLC

Runyan 
Pottery 
Supply

ART 3430
Clay School White Earthenware Grey Bodied Low-
Fire, 50 Pound Carton, Runyan SC-225 or 
Equal/Better 

50 Pound 
Carton  No Bid  Winning Bid

 $30.52  $  44.10  No Bid  No  Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $  38.00 



Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025 
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies 

3600 FIRST AID/HEALTH: BANDAGES, KWIK KOLD, RUBBER GLOVES 

 Supply 
Area 

Item 
Number Description  Unit 

of Bid 

APAC  
 Paper 

& Pkg 

Imperial 
Dade 

 Pyramid 
 School 

Products 
 Quill LLC Unipak 

OFF. 3620 Bandages, Adhesive, 1 Inch By 3 Inch, Latex Free,  
 Flexible Fabric, Sterile, Individually Wrapped, Box Of 100 Box of 100  No Bid $ 10.81  No Bid 

 Winning 
Bid 

$7.92 
 No Bid 

CUST. 3653 

Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, Non-Sterile, Powder Free,  
FDA Accepted Materials, Ambidextrous,  

  Medical Grade (Examination), 100 Per Box, 10 Boxes Per 
 Case, 1,000 Per Case,  

   Small, Tradex VSm 200 Or Equal/Better (Must Specify) 

 Case of 
10 Boxes

 Winning 
Bid 

$18.90 
$ 21.29 $     26.90 $ 22.72 $ 24.00 

CUST. 3655 

Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, Non-Sterile, Powder Free,  
FDA Accepted Materials, Ambidextrous,  

  Medical Grade (Examination), 100 Per Box, 10 Boxes Per 
  Case, 1,000 Per Case, 

 Medium, Tradex Vmd 200 Or Equal/Better (Must Specify) 

 Case of 
10 Boxes

 Winning 
Bid 

$18.90 
$ 21.29 $     26.90 $ 39.96 $ 24.00 

CUST. 3657 

 Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, Non-Sterile, Powder Free, 
 FDA Accepted Materials, Ambidextrous, 

  Medical Grade (Examination), 100 Per Box, 10 Boxes Per 
  Case, 1,000 Per Case, 

 Large, Tradex Vlg 200 Or Equal/Better (Must Specify) 

 Case of 
10 Boxes

 Winning 
Bid 

$18.90 
$ 21.29 $     26.90 $ 25.28 $ 24.00 

CUST. 3659 

 Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, Non-Sterile, Powder Free, 
 FDA Accepted Materials, Ambidextrous, 

  Medical Grade (Examination), 100 Per Box, 10 Boxes Per 
  Case, 1,000 Per Case, 

   Extra-Large, Tradex Vxl 200 Or Equal/Better (Must 
Specify) 

 Case of 
10 Boxes

 Winning 
Bid 

$18.90 
$ 21.29 $       26.90 $ 28.82 $ 24.00 

CUST. 3661 

 Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, Non-Sterile, Powder Free, 
 FDA Accepted Materials, Ambidextrous, 

 Industrial/Food Service Grade, 100 Per Box, 10 Boxes Per 
  Case, 1,000 Per Case, 

  Small, Tradex Vsm 5201 Or Equal/Better (Must Specify) 

 Case of 
10 Boxes

 Winning 
Bid 

$17.90 
$ 21.29 $     26.90 $ 4.08 $ 17.50 

CUST. 3663 

 Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, Non-Sterile, Powder Free, 
 FDA Accepted Materials, Ambidextrous, 

  Industrial/Food Service Grade, 100 Per Box, 10 Boxes Per 
  Case, 1,000 Per Case, 

Medium, Tradex Vmd 5201 Or Equal/Better (Must Specify) 

 Case of 
10 Boxes

 Winning 
Bid 

$17.90 
$ 21.29 $     26.90 $ 39.96 $ 17.50 

CUST. 3665 

 Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable, Non-Sterile, Powder Free, 
 FDA Accepted Materials, Ambidextrous, 

  Industrial/Food Service Grade, 100 Per Box, 10 Boxes Per 
  Case, 1,000 Per Case, 

 Large, Tradex Vlg 5201 Or Equal/Better (Must Specify) 

 Case of 
10 Boxes

 Winning 
Bid 

$17.90 
$ 21.29 $     26.90  No Bid $ 17.50 

CUST. 3667 

Gloves, Vinyl, Disposable,  Non-Sterile, Powder Free,  
FDA Accepted Materials, Ambidextrous,  

  Industrial/Food Service Grade, 100 Per Box, 10 Boxes Per 
Case,  1,000 Per Case,  
Extra-Large Tradex Vxl 5201 Or Equal/Better (Must  
Specify) 

Case of  
10 Boxes

 Winning 
Bid 

$17.90 
$ 21.29 $     26.90 $ 28.82 $ 17.50 



Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025 
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies 

3700 TRASH CAN LINERS (TRASH BAGS) 

 Supply 
Area 

Item 
Number Description  Unit 

of Bid 

APAC  
 Paper 

& Pkg 

Imperial 
Dade  Quill LLC Unipak 

Corp 

CUST. 3710 

Trash Can Liners,  
High Density Clear Plastic,  
Star Sealed,  
20-30 Gallon,  
500 Liners Per Carton,  

 30 Inch X 37 Inch Size Minimums,  
 Minimum Net Weight (Liners Only): 11.65 Pounds,  
 Minimum Thickness: 8.0 Microns,  

Must Satisfy Weight-Thickness Formula Both Ways. 

Carton of 500 
Only  $  13.95 $  16.42 $  27.49  Winning Bid 

$12.40 

CUST. 3711 

Trash Can Liners,  
High Density Clear Plastic,  
Star Sealed,  
20-30 Gallon,  
500 Liners Per Carton,  

 Must Be Packed As Coreless Rolls,  
30 Inch X 37 Inch Size Minimums,  

 Minimum Net Weight (Liners Only): 14.57 Pounds,  
 Minimum Thickness: 10.0 Microns,  

Must Satisfy Weight-Thickness Formula Both Ways.   

Carton of 500 
Packed as  

Coreless Rolls
 $  17.70 $    13.67 $  36.72  Winning Bid 

$14.73 

CUST. 3722 

Trash Can Liners,  
High Density Clear Plastic,  
Star Sealed,  
55 Gallon,  
200 Liners Per Carton,  

 Must Be Packed As Coreless Rolls, 
36-38 Inch X 58-60 Inch Size Minimums,  

 Minimum Net Weight (Liners Only): 18.14 Pounds,  
 Minimum Thickness: 16.0 Microns,  

Must Satisfy Weight-Thickness Formula Both Ways.  

Carton of 200 
Packed as  

Coreless Rolls
 $  22.30 $  17.90 $    35.99  Winning Bid 

$18.49 

CUST. 3731 

Trash Can Liners,  
High Density Clear Plastic,  
Star Sealed,  
33 Gallon,  
500 Liners Per Carton,   

 Must Be Packed As Coreless Rolls, 
 33 Inch X 40 Inch Size Minimum,  

 Minimum Net Weight (Liners Only): 20.79 Pounds,  
 Minimum Thickness: 12.0 Microns,  

Must Satisfy Weight-Thickness Formula Both Ways.  

Carton of 500 
Packed as  

Coreless Rolls
 $  23.70 $  19.70 $    35.05  Winning Bid 

$21.40 

CUST. 3742 

Trash Can Liners,  
High Density Clear Plastic,  
Star Sealed,  
40 Gallon,  
250 Liners Per Carton,  

 Must Be Packed As Coreless Rolls, 
 40 Inch X 48 Inch Size Minimums,  

 Minimum Net Weight (Liners Only): 20.16 Pounds,  
 Minimum Thickness: 16.0 Microns,  

Must Satisfy Weight-Thickness Formula Both Ways.  

Carton of 250 
Packed as  

Coreless Rolls
 $  23.39 $  20.26  No Bid  Winning Bid 

$20.20 

CUST. 3750 

Trash Can Liners,  
High Density,  
Black,  
Star Sealed,  
250 Per Case,  

 30 Inch X 37 Inch,   
 Minimum Net Weight (Liners Only): 11.65 Pounds,  

16 Microns 

Carton of 250  $  14.68 $  23.19  No Bid  Winning Bid 
$12.39 



 Supply 
Area 

Item 
Number Description  Unit 

of Bid 

APAC  
 Paper 

& Pkg 

Imperial 
Dade  Quill LLC Unipak 

Corp 

CUST. 3751 

Trash Can Liners,  
High Density,  
Clear,  
Star Sealed,  
10 Gallon, 
1,000 Liners Per Carton,  
Must Be Packed As Coreless Rolls, 

 24 Inch X 24 Inch,  
20 Microns 

Carton of  
1,000 

Packed as  
Coreless Rolls

 $  38.21 $  32.00  No Bid  Winning Bid 
$38.00 

CUST. 3752 

Trash Can Liners,  
High Density,   
Black, 
Star Sealed,  
30 Gallon, 
500 Liners Per Carton,  
Must Be Packed As Coreless Rolls, 

 30 Inch X 37 Inch,  
22 Microns 

Carton of 500 
Packed as  

Coreless Rolls
 $  40.40  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid 

$32.30 

CUST. 3753 

Trash Can Liners,  
High Density,  
Black,  
Star Sealed,  
150 Per Case,  

 38 Inch X 60 Inch,  
 Minimum Net Weight (Liners Only): 19.75 Pounds,  

22 Microns 

Carton of 150  $  23.27 $  24.08  No Bid  Winning Bid 
$19.88 

CUST. 3754 

Trash Can Liners,  
High Density,   
Black, 
Star Sealed,  
55 Gallon, 
150 Liners Per Carton,  
Must Be Packed As Coreless Rolls, 

 38 Inch X 60 Inch,  
22 Microns 

Carton of 500 
Packed as  

Coreless Rolls
 $  23.37 $  24.08  No Bid  Winning Bid 

$19.88 

CUST. 3756 

Trash Can Liners,  
High Density,   
Black, 
Star Sealed,  
150 Per Case,  

 43 Inch X 48 Inch,  
 Minimum Net Weight (Liners Only): 17.88 Pounds,  

22 Microns 

Carton of 150  $  21.05 $  17.34  No Bid  Winning Bid 
$17.95 

CUST. 3757 

Trash Can Liners,  
High Density,   
Black, 
Star Sealed,  
56 Gallon, 
150 Liners Per Carton,  
Must Be Packed As Coreless Rolls, 

 43 Inch X 48 Inch,  
22 Microns 

Carton of 150 
Packed as  

Coreless Rolls
 $  21.05 $  17.34  No Bid  Winning Bid 

$17.95 

Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025 
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies 



Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies

3800 BUILDING CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES: WASTE CONTAINERS

Supply 
Area

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Imperial 
Dade

Pyramid 
School 

Products
Quill LLC

Waste Receptacle, Plastic, 44 Gallon Capacity 
Heavy Duty, Molded Container Gray Color, 4 Per Carton, 

CUST. 3803
Mobile - With Heavy Duty Ball Bearing Casters, Seamless, 
Sanitary Construction Cannot Rust, Dent, Or Break, Carton of 4  No Bid  $         35.12  Winning Bid

$371.92  No Bid 
USSA Accepted Will Withstand All Temperature Extremes

3900 BUILDING CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES:MOPS, SPONGES, SPRAYERS, TOWELS

Supply 
Area

   

   

   

 

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Imperial 
Dade

Pyramid 
School 

Products
Quill LLC

CUST. 3910 Bottle 32 Ounce Plastic Each  Winning Bid
$0.69  $           0.61  $          0.71  $  1.38 

CUST. 3913 Sprayer Trigger 9 1/4 Inch Chemical Resistant, 
Compatible With 32 Ounce Spray Bottle (Item 3910) Each  Winning Bid

$0.41  $           1.52  $          0.82  No Bid 

CUST. 3930 Toilet Brush Case Of 100, 
Handle- Tolco #280100

 Swab With White Plastic Case of 100  Winning Bid
$80.50  $         93.00  $        89.00  No Bid 

CUST. 3932
Wet Mop 16 oz Web Foot Blend Shrinkless, Small 1" 
Headband White Cotton Synthetic Blend Rubbermaid 
FGA21106WH00

Package of 6  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid
$53.94  No Bid 

CUST. 3933
Wet Mop 20 oz Web Foot Blend Shrinkless Medium 1" 
Headband Blue Cotton Synthetic Blend Rubbermaid 
FGA21206BL00

Package of 6  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid
$61.74  No Bid 

CUST. 3934
Wet Mop 24 oz Web Foot Blend Shrinkless, Large 1" 
Headband White Cotton Synthetic Blend Rubbermaid 
FGA21306WH00

Package of 6  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid
$67.74  No Bid 

CUST. 3935 Towel Cloth Blue Microfiber Cloth, 16 Inch X 16 Inch Pack of 12  Winning Bid
$7.15  $         20.25  $        13.08  $  9.27 

CUST. 3936 Towel Cloth Green Microfiber Cloth, 16 Inch X 16 Inch Pack of 12  Winning Bid
$7.15  $         20.25  $        13.08  $  9.27 

CUST. 3950

Rags All Cotton 100% Terrycloth Washed 
Approximately 15 Inches X 15 Inches No Buttons, Seams, 
Zippers, Or Polyester, 25 Pound Bundle Or Carton Ace-
Tex Wiping Cloth 

25 Pound 
Bundle

 or Carton

 Winning Bid
$28.85  $         57.84  $        59.98  No Bid 

CUST. 3965 Sponge Scouring 20 Per Carton 3M #74 Carton of 20  $              53.60  Winning Bid
$42.70  $        50.99  No Bid 

CUST. 3966 Sponge Scouring 20 Per Carton Niagra 74N BY 3M Carton of 20  Winning Bid
$31.35  $         70.46  $        41.98  No Bid 

CUST. 3970
Stripper Pad, Black, Round, Nylon/Polyester, 3/4 Inch 
Thickness, 3.375 Inch Center Hole, 20 Inch Diameter, 
Coarse, 175-600 RPM, 5 Per Case, 3M 7200

Case of 5  $              38.20  Winning Bid
$29.12  No Bid  $  34.48 

CUST. 3975
Vacuum Cleaner Bag, Filter Bag, Compatible with Karcher 
Tornado CV30, CV38, NSS Pacer 112UE, 115UE, 
Replacement Part for K69043050, 15 Per Package

Package of 
15  $              98.95  Winning Bid

$9.99  No Bid  No Bid 

CUST. 3980 Sweeper Brushless Mechanical Black Rubbermaid 4215-
88 Each  Winning Bid

$65.40  $         97.66  $        94.95  No Bid 



Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025 
Bid Tabulation for Art, Custodial, and Office Supplies 

4000 CLEANING CHEMICALS: AIR FRESHENER, GLASS CLEANER, DISINFECTANTS
          DRAIN OPENERS, TOILET BOWL, SALT, LIQUID SOAP, WIPES  

 Supply 
Area 

Item 
Number Description  Unit 

of Bid 

APAC  
Paper 
& Pkg 

Imperial 
Dade 

 Pyramid 
School 

Products 
Quill 

CUST. 4005 Bio-Enzyme Odor Digester, 4 Gallons/Case Air X RX-66  Case of 
4 Gallons  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

CUST. 4007 Bleach 6.0% Solution 128 Oz. 6/Case Austin's 101  Case of 
6 Gallons

 Winning Bid 
$19.80 $ 21.91  No Bid  No Bid 

CUST. 4009 Cleaner Glass 5 Gallon Bag-In-Box Windex DRK90122 Each  Winning Bid 
$31.88 $ 32.46  No Bid  No Bid 

CUST. 4011 Disinfectant/Cleaner 32 Oz. Bottle 12 Bottles/Case 
RX 75 Tuberculocidal Heavy Duty Cleaner Case of 12  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

CUST. 4019  Disinfectant/Cleaner, Gallon Bottle, 4 Bottles/Case, 
 AIRX 44 HDQ Hospital Disinfectant 

 Case of 
4 Gallons  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

CUST. 4025 Drain Opener Alkaline 32 Oz. Bottle, 12 Bottles/Case Case of 12  No Bid  Winning Bid 
$35.66  No Bid  No Bid 

CUST. 4029  Hand Sanitizer, Gel, 8 Oz., Pump Top, Case Of 24, Germs 
Be Gone Or Equal/Better (Must Specify) Case of 24  Winning Bid 

$55.58 $ 63.29  No Bid  No Bid 

CUST. 4030 Hand Sanitizer, Waterless, Gel, AloeVera, 18 Oz., Pump 
Top, Case Of 16, DermaGel Or Equal/Better (Must Specify) Case of 16  $ 55.58  Winning Bid 

$61.17  No Bid  No Bid 

CUST. 4035 

 Liquid Toilet Bowl Cleaner, 12 Quarts/Carton, 
23% Hydrogen Chloride, 2.5% Dehydro-Abietylamine 
With: Wetting Agent, Metal Inhibitor, Detergents and 

 Deodorant, 
Canberra Husky 303 

Carton of  
12 Quarts  No Bid  Winning Bid 

$24.39  No Bid  No Bid 

CUST. 4040 

 Liquid Toilet Bowl Cleaner 12 Quarts/Carton, 
 9.5% Hydrogen Chloride 2.5% Dehydro-Abietylamine 

With: Wetting Agent, Metal Inhibitor, Detergents and 
Deodorant, Spartan M-95 

Carton of  
12 Quarts  No Bid  Winning Bid 

$24.39  No Bid  No Bid 

CUST. 4075 
Salt Pellets Water Softener, 50 Pound Bags, Skid Of 49 

 Bags, 
Kissner Solar Salt Or Equal/Better (Must Specify) 

Skid of 49 
50 Pound Bags  No Bid  Winning Bid 

$433.65  No Bid  No Bid 

CUST. 4080 
Salt Rock Salt Ice Melter, 50 Pound Bags, Skid Of 49 

 Bags, 
Kissner Ice Patrol Or Equal/Better (Must Specify) 

Skid of 49 
50 Pound Bags

 Winning Bid 
$365.05 $ 519.00  No Bid  No Bid 

CUST. 4086 Soap Dishwashing 24 Oz. Bottle, 10 Bottles/Case, P&G 
Ivory Classic Dishwashing Liquid SKU#PGC25574 Case of 10  $ 33.60  Winning Bid 

$33.51 $ 45.99 $ 43.03 

CUST. 4089  Soap, Liquid, Dial Antimicrobal, 7.5 Oz, Decorative Pump, 
12/Box Dial DIA84014 Box of 12  $ 40.25  Winning Bid 

$35.01 $ 46.98  No Bid 

CUST. 4092  Soap, GOJO, Premium Foam Refill, 1200ML, 2/box 
GOJO# 5361-02 Box of 2  $ 52.35 $ 56.35 $ 67.98 

 Winning 
Bid 

$49.99 

CUST. 4095 
 Wipes Disinfecting, 80 Wipes/Pouch, 6 Canisters/Case, 

 Lemon Scent Lysol Disinfecting Wipes 
# 19200-77182CT 

Case of 6  Winning Bid 
$29.80  No Bid $ 36.98 $ 32.24 



Genesee Area School Business Officials (GASBO) Cooperative Purchasing Program 2024 - 2025
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4100 LIGHTING: BALLASTS, BULBS, LAMPS

Supply 
Area

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Imperial 
Dade

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products

Voss 
Lighting

CUST. 4120

LED InstantFit Lamp 17T8 Pro LED/48-4000 BB G 
1PK 10/1 G13 Base Medium Bi-Pin 2100 Lumens 
4000K Color 17 Watts 1200 mm Length Bypass 
Ballast/Type B Phillips# 929001363304

Case of 
10  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid

$83.30 

CUST. 4140 Lamp 2650 Lumens 34 Watts T12 Energy Saver 
Case Of 30 No Disposal Costs 

Case of 
30  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid

$109.80 

CUST. 4160 Lamp 2800 Lumens 32 Watts T8 4 Foot Fluorescent, 
No Disposal Cost Each  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid

$3.23 

CUST. 4180 Electronic Ballast 4 Bulb Rhtp Type Each  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid
$15.74 

CUST. 4190

Bulb, Compact Fluorescent, Light Energy Star 
Qualified, 13-15w (60w Incandescent Equivalent), 900 
Lumens, 10,000 Hours, 2700K (Warm White), 
Suitable for Open Or Closed Fixtures

Each  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid
$4.00 

CUST. 4192

Bulb, Compact Fluorescent Light, Energy Star 
Qualified, 23W (100W Incandescent Equivalent), 
1600 Lumens, 10,000 Hours, 5000K (Daylight) 
Suitable for Open or Closed Fixtures

Each  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid
$5.70 

CUST. 4196
Bulb, LED Light, Energy Star Qualified, 16 Watts (100 
Watts Incandescent Equivalent), 120V, A19, Medium 
Screw (E26) Base, 2700K Warm White, Dimmable

Each  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  Winning Bid
$5.89 

4500 BATTERIES

Supply 
Area

                  

                  

         

Item 
Number Description Unit 

of Bid

APAC 
Paper 
& Pkg

Cascade 
School 

Supplies

Imperial 
Dade

Nat'l Art & 
School 

Supplies

Pyramid 
School 

Products

Voss 
Lighting

CUST. 4501

Battery, Alkaline, 1.5 Volts, Size AAA, Package Of 24, 
Recommended Use By Dated Not Before 2029 
Printed On Each Battery, Ray-O-Vac Or Equal/Better-
Major Well-known Brand Only, Must Specify Brand 

Package 
of 24  $ 12.79  $  11.70  $  9.47  Winning Bid

$8.19  $  9.12  No Bid 

CUST. 4503

Battery, Alkaline, 1.5 Volts, Size AA, Package Of 24, 
Recommended Use By Dated Not Before 2029 
Printed On Each Battery, Ray-O-Vac Or Equal/Better-
Major Well-known Brand Only, Must Specify Brand 

Package 
of 24  $ 12.19  $  10.65  $  9.57  Winning Bid

$8.19  $  9.12  No Bid 

CUST. 4509

Battery, Alkaline, 9 Volts, Package Of 12, 
Recommended Use By Dated Not Before 2029 
Printed On Each Battery, Ray-O-Vac Or Equal/Better-
Major Well-known Brand Only, Must Specify Brand 

Package 
of 12  $ 21.99  No Bid  $  21.06  Winning Bid

$15.25  $  16.98  No Bid 
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